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The Police have this power to stop youths 

gathering and causing a disturbance 
which might affect other people. 

 
 

 
 

Dispersal Order 

 
 
Children at this age can go anywhere in a 
pub as long as they are supervised by an 
adult but cannot have an alcoholic drink. 
 
 

 
 

Under 16 years 

 
Young people at this age can drink beer, 

wine, cider or perry with a meal if it is 
bought by an adult and they are 

accompanied by an adult. It is illegal for 
this age group to drink spirits in pubs 

even with a meal. 

 
 
 

16 or 17 years  

 
It is against the law for anyone under this 

age to buy alcohol in a pub, off licence 
supermarket or other outlet, or for 

anyone to buy alcohol for someone under 
this age to consume in a pub or a public 

place. 
 

 
 

 
Under 18 years of age 

 
It is an offence to drive with more than 
this amount of alcohol in your blood. 

 
 
 
 

 
80 milligrams of alcohol in 100 millilitres 

of blood 
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It is an offence to drive with more than 

this amount of alcohol in your body. 
 
 

 

 
 

35 micrograms of alcohol in 100 millilitres 
of breath 

 
 

The maximum penalty for a first offence 
of drinking and driving. 

 
 

Maximum £5000 and / or up to 6 months 
imprisonment and mandatory 

disqualification for at least 12 months. 
 

 
 

To drink excessively in one session is 
called.......... 

 
 

Binge Drinking 
 
 
 
 

 
Police can do this if young people under 

18 are drinking in a public place and 
creating disorder or where the officer 
believes that the child will consume it. 

 
 

 
 

Confiscate the alcohol. 

 
 

Bar staff can receive this fixed penalty fine 
for serving someone who is under 18. 

 
 

 
 
Bar staff will be cautioned and given a £90 

fine. 
However, Licence can be taken from 

landlord for persistent offending.  
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The time it takes for the body to get rid of 

1 unit of alcohol is ........ 
 

(1 unit = small glas of wine; 35ml 
measure of Spirits; 275ml bottle 
Alcopops; 250ml Lager).  

 
 

1 hour 

 
 

Any Social Behaviour that may upset 
someone or is against the Law is called .... 
 
 
 
 

 
 

Anti Social Behaviour 
(ASB) 

 


